
Past Sheriff Sale List Wednesday, January 06, 2016
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01/15/15 14CV0114 Bollinger 7291 North State Route 269, Bellevue, 

Ohio 44811

$22,500.00 Plaintiff $19,000.00$15,000.00

01/15/15 14CV0159 Jones 935937 North Union Street, Fostoria, 

Ohio 44830

$32,000.00 Plaintiff $21,334.00$21,334.00

01/15/15 14CV0211 Miller 22 Tiffin Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $40,000.00 Plaintiff $26,667.00$26,667.00

14CV0240 Mitchell 162 Webster Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $58,000.00 N/A $-00$38,667.00

01/15/15 14CV0226 Poland 292 West Perry Street, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$39,000.00 Herman J. Kinn $26,500.00$26,000.00

01/15/15 14CV0256 Roberts 101 Washington Street, Bettsville, Ohio 

44815

$40,000.00 Plaintiff $26,667.00$26,667.00

01/15/15 14CV0110 Swander 105 East Lytle Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

John C. Thomas $5,909.48$5,909.48

12CV0433 Vanover 182 Walker Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 N/A $-00$10,837.47

14CV0069 Foreman 49 Main Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $48,000.00 N/A $-00$32,000.00

01/29/15 14CV0258 Hopple 662 Maple Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$15,000.00 Plaintiff $10,000.00$10,000.00

01/29/15 14CV0033 Rublaitus 376 Water Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $16,500.00 Plaintiff $31,000.00$11,000.00

14CV0209 Ryan 250 Charlotte Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $21,000.00 N/A $-00$14,000.00

13CV0235 Salas 1737 East County 51, Old Fort, Ohio 

44861

$9,000.00 N/A $-00$6,000.00
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14CV0110 Swander 105 East Lytle Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

John C. Thomas $-00$5,909.48

12CV0433 Vanover 182 Walker Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 N/A $-00$10,837.47

02/12/15 13CV0310 Dorsey 306 West Tiffin Street, Attica, Ohio 

44807

$63,000.00 Plaintiff $42,000.00$42,000.00

02/12/15 14CV0224 Hess 20 Prospect Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $45,000.00 Plaintiff $52,407.33$30,000.00

02/12/15 14CV0259 White 479 North Township Road 66, Fostoria, 

Ohio 44830

$75,000.00 Gerald M. and Ashley J. 

Reinhart

$55,000.00$50,000.00

10CV0624 Link 220 Clay Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 N/A $-00$8,710.06

02/26/15 14CV0238 Schock 29 Grace Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $21,000.00 Plaintiff $14,500.00$14,000.00

02/26/15 14CV0208 Thompson 410 David Street, Bettsville, Ohio 

44815

$51,000.00 Plaintiff $34,000.00$34,000.00

03/12/15 13CV0380 DeWeese 4624 West US 224, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 Thomas E Helms and 

Patricia C Thomas

$14,000.00$10,379.84

03/12/15 14CV0133 Halcomb 316 Sullivan Street, Bettsville, Ohio 

44815

$80,000.00 Plaintiff $53,334.00$53,334.00

10CV0624 Link 220 Clay Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 N/A $-00$8,710.06

03/12/15 14CV0240 Mitchell 162 Webster Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $58,000.00 Plaintiff $59,200.00$38,667.00

03/12/15 13CV0346 Nye 113 and 113 1/2 North Union, 

Fostoria, Ohio 44830

$24,000.00 No Bid No Sale $-00$16,000.00

03/12/15 13CV0346 Nye 610 and 0 Columbus Avenue, Fostoria, 

Ohio 44830

$21,000.00 No Bid No Sale $-00$14,000.00
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03/12/15 13CV0346 Nye 525 South Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$27,000.00 No Bid No Sale $-00$18,000.00

03/12/15 14CV0170 Nye 949 Walnut Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

Plaintiff $15,400.00$15,400.00

03/12/15 13CV0346 Nye 301 Jackson Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$25,000.00 No Bid No Sale $-00$16,667.00

03/26/15 14CV0279 Attica FOE 10 South Main Street, Attica, Ohio 

44807

No Bid No Sale $-00$13,107.55

03/26/15 14CV0298 Bronston 734 South Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$32,000.00 Plaintiff $21,334.00$21,334.00

03/26/15 14CV0271 Burns 112 Hancock Steet and 0 Hancock 

Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883

$15,000.00 Stewart A. Bowersox $16,000.00$10,000.00

14CV0192 Fadeley 199 4th Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $10,000.00 N/A $-00$6,667.00

03/26/15 14CV0318 Feehan 109 Franklin Street, Bettsville, Ohio 

44815

$20,000.00 Plaintiff $13,334.00$13,334.00

03/26/15 14CV0301 Webb 1709 East Country Road 36, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

$55,000.00 Plaintiff $79,000.00$36,667.00

04/09/15 14CV0279 Attica FOE 10 South Main Street, Attica, Ohio 

44807

No Bid No Sale $-00$13,107.55

14CV0317 Burwell 24 East Market Street, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$10,729.79

14CV0317 Burwell 0 West High Street, Attica, Ohio 44807 $1,686.72

14CV0317 Burwell 0 West High Street, Attica, Ohio 44807 $1,724.31

14CV0317 Burwell 105 West High Street, Attica, Ohio 

44807

N/A $-00$7,913.03
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04/09/15 14CV0344 Clark 6323 North Township Road 71, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

$33,000.00 Plaintiff $83,301.48$22,000.00

04/09/15 14CV0223 Miller 105 East South Trail, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $44,700.00 Plaintiff $50,000.00$29,800.00

04/09/15 14CV0285 Newland 348 Riverside Drive, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $68,300.00 Plaintiff $45,534.00$45,534.00

14CV0261 Provino 3453 South Township Road 66, New 

Riegel, Ohio 448539602

$43,500.00 N/A $-00$29,000.00

04/09/15 14CV0283 Smith 12 Railroad Street, Bloomville, Ohio 

44818

$24,600.00 Plaintiff $16,400.00$16,400.00

14CV0317 Burwell 24 East Market Street, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$10,729.79

14CV0317 Burwell 105 West High Street, Attica, Ohio 

44807

$7,913.03

14CV0317 Burwell 0 West High Street, Attica, Ohio 44807 $1,686.72

14CV0317 Burwell 0 West High Street, Attica, Ohio 44807 $1,724.31

14CV0280 Chavez 37 Longfellow Drive, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $63,000.00 N/A $-00$42,000.00

05/07/15 14CV0296 Ganni 95 Erie Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $65,000.00 Plaintiff $43,334.00$43,334.00

05/07/15 15CV0003 Schroth 235 Coe Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $98,000.00 Betty M. Furrow $82,300.00$65,334.00

15CV0022 Tong 49 Boehler Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $54,000.00 N/A $-00$36,000.00

05/21/15 15CV0024 Craddolph 737 Circle Drive, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 $30,000.00 Plaintiff $20,000.00$20,000.00
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05/21/15 14CV0213 Gibson 417 Union Ct., Fostoria, OH 44830 $35,000.00 Plaintiff $23,334.00$23,334.00

05/21/15 14CV0282 Hartsel 5081 Township Road 36, Kansas, Ohio 

44841

$75,000.00 Plaintiff $50,000.00$50,000.00

05/21/15 14CV0345 Jones 111 East Crocker Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$19,000.00 Plaintiff $12,667.00$12,667.00

05/21/15 14CV0352 Sowers 8614 East County Road 12, Bloomville, 

Ohio 44818

$135,000.00 Heather and Jason Hood $91,000.00$90,000.00

05/21/15 12CV0131 West 691 North State Route 587, Fostoria, 

Ohio 44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$12,000.00

06/04/15 15CV0028 Behm 950 East Township Road 1172, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

$155,000.00 CitiMortgage, Inc. $103,334.00$103,334.00

15CV0006 Bowman 133 East 4th Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$16,000.00 N/A $-00$10,667.00

06/04/15 14CV0312 Schock 2284 West County Road 52, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

$175,000.00 Jacob J. Rishty and Laura 

A. Rishty

$168,000.00$116,667.00

06/04/15 15CV0026 Thacker 25 Henry Street, Tiffin, OH 448831143 $59,000.00 U.S. Bank National 

Association, as Trustee

$39,334.00$39,334.00

06/04/15 15CV0035 Tiffin Central Labor Home Co 240 North Washington Street, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

Brenda and Steve McCoy $27,500.00$7,520.48

06/04/15 15CV0023 Wilkie 209 Third Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $43,000.00 First Federal Bank of Ohio $51,189.35$28,667.00

06/18/15 14CV0192 Fadeley 199 4th Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $10,000.00 Plaintiff $11,600.00$6,667.00

06/18/15 10CV0326 Messer 7319 North Township Road 70, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

$102,000.00 Plaintiff $68,000.00$68,000.00

06/18/15 14CV0278 Shiley, Estate of 1082 South Brace Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

No Bid No Sale $-00$9,784.95
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06/18/15 14CV0037 Theis 2922 East County Road 50, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$49,000.00 Plaintiff $33,702.00$32,667.00

15CV0035 Tiffin Central Labor Home Co 240 North Washington Street, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

$-00$7,520.48

07/02/15 14CV0248 Beasley 401 Colonial Drive, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$33,000.00 Randy L. Cunningham $25,500.00$22,000.00

07/02/15 15CV0053 Currier 52 Tomb Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $45,000.00 Plaintiff $40,000.00$30,000.00

14CV0284 Golden 264 Vine Street, Tiffin, Ohion 44883 $42,000.00 N/A $-00$28,000.00

07/02/15 14CV0278 Shiley, Estate of 1082 South Brace Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

No Bid No Sale $-00$9,784.95

15CV0055 Slane 205 West Adams Street, Green 

Springs, Ohio 44836

$33,000.00 N/A $-00$22,000.00

07/02/15 15CV0033 Strohl 703 Northview Drive, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$18,000.00 Plaintiff $27,200.00$12,000.00

15CV0078 Cooper 245 Franklin Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $15,000.00 na $-00$10,000.00

07/16/15 14CV0164 Coppus 69 West Woodmere, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$150,000.00 Plaintiff $100,000.00$100,000.00

15CV0049 Kimmet 204 South Jefferson Street, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$25,000.00 N/A $-00$16,667.00

07/30/15 15CV0006 Bowman 133 East 4th Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$16,000.00 Plaintiff $10,667.00$10,667.00

07/30/15 15CV0016 Feasel 771 South Washington Street, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

$64,000.00 Plaintiff $42,667.00$42,667.00

07/30/15 15CV0048 McNutt 97 Wentz Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $70,000.00 Plaintiff $46,667.00$46,667.00
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07/30/15 15CV0074 Miles 720 Eastern Avenue, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$42,000.00 Plaintiff $30,600.00$28,000.00

07/30/15 14CV0316 Westenbarger 565 North Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

John C. Thomas $16,187.72$16,187.72

08/13/15 14CV0270 Hammer 716 Circle Drive, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 $33,000.00 Randy L. Cunningham $23,000.00$22,000.00

13CV0148 Hornyak 12692 Township Road 178, Bellevue, 

Ohio 44811

$33,500.00 N/A $-00$22,334.00

08/13/15 15CV0106 Michaels 28 Walker Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $38,000.00 Plaintiff $25,334.00$25,334.00

08/13/15 15CV0068 Morton 917 Spruce Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$7,343.55

14CV0316 Westenbarger 565 North Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$-00$16,187.72

15CV0061 Krupp 7301 South Township Road 117, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

$183,500.00 N/A $-00$122,334.00

08/27/15 15CV0068 Morton 917 Spruce Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$7,343.55

08/27/15 15CV0075 Owens 6521 North County Road 31, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

$16,500.00 Plaintiff $11,000.00$11,000.00

08/27/15 15CV0097 Peacock 10 Hampden Park, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $85,000.00 Plaintiff $125,000.00$56,667.00

08/27/15 15CV0055 Slane 205 West Adams Street, Green 

Springs, Ohio 44836

$33,000.00 Plaintiff $22,000.00$22,000.00

09/10/15 15CV0078 Cooper 245 Franklin Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $15,000.00 Plaintiff $19,000.00$10,000.00

09/10/15 14CV0349 First Baptist Church 521 Lynn Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 No Bid No Sale $-00$2,501.74
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09/10/15 14CV0349 First Baptist Church 520 Lynn Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 No Bid No Sale $-00$3,274.34

09/10/15 14CV0349 First Baptist Church 531 Lynn Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 No Bid No Sale $-00$13,047.42

09/10/15 15CV0027 Jones 438 South Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$26,000.00 Plaintiff $17,334.00$17,334.00

09/10/15 15CV0058 Kubasek 0 West County Road 59, Carey, Ohio 

43316

No Bid No Sale $-00$1,458.22

09/10/15 15CV0058 Kubasek 8100 West County Road 59, Carey, 

Ohio 43316

No Bid No Sale $-00$6,731.07

09/10/15 15CV0058 Kubasek 8110 West County Road 59, Carey, 

Ohio 43316

No Bid No Sale $-00$1,399.49

09/10/15 15CV0103 Ledwedge 94 Sycamore Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $85,000.00 No Bid No Sale $-00$56,667.00

09/10/15 14CV0319 Mora 332 Elm Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 $42,000.00 Plaintiff $28,000.00$28,000.00

14CV0358 Williams 800 South Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$45,000.00 N/A $-00$30,000.00

09/24/15 14CV0349 First Baptist Church 521 Lynn Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 No Bid No Sale $-00$2,501.74

09/24/15 14CV0349 First Baptist Church 520 Lynn Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 No Bid No Sale $-00$3,274.34

09/24/15 14CV0349 First Baptist Church 531 Lynn Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 No Bid No Sale $-00$13,047.42

09/24/15 15CV0132 Grine 212 East Crocker Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$5,689.82

09/24/15 14CV0327 Hetzel 353 South Monroe Street, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$80,000.00 Plaintiff $53,334.00$53,334.00
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09/24/15 15CV0058 Kubasek 0 West County Road 59, Carey, Ohio 

43316

No Bid No Sale $-00$1,458.22

09/24/15 15CV0058 Kubasek 8100 West County Road 59, Carey, 

Ohio 43316

No Bid No Sale $-00$6,731.07

09/24/15 15CV0058 Kubasek 8110 West County Road 59, Carey, 

Ohio 43316

No Bid No Sale $-00$1,399.49

09/24/15 15CV0136 Mears 329 North Sandusky Street, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$79,000.00 Plaintiff $52,667.00$52,667.00

09/24/15 15CV0130 Patillo 183 Second Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 No Bid No Sale $-00$8,955.75

09/24/15 15CV0130 Patillo 0 Second Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 No Bid No Sale $-00$1,902.38

09/24/15 15CV0112 Seaburn 436 McDougal Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$7,623.15

15CV0110 Wickham 2727 West US Highway 224, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

N/A $-00

10/08/15 14CV0069 Foreman 49 Main Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $30,000.00 U.S. Bank, National 

Association

$20,000.00$20,000.00

10/08/15 15CV0132 Grine 212 East Crocker Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$5,689.82

10/08/15 15CV0031 Nighswander 1707 Meadowlake Drive, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$147,000.00 Plaintiff $132,000.00$98,000.00

10/08/15 15CV0130 Patillo 183 Second Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 Rayan Hanna $10,858.13$8,955.75

10/08/15 15CV0130 Patillo 0 Second Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 Rayan Hanna $-00$1,902.38

10/08/15 15CV0112 Seaburn 436 McDougal Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$7,623.15
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10/08/15 15CV0162 Tucker 137 Hall Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $54,000.00 Plaintiff $36,000.00$36,000.00

11/05/15 15CV0148 Baxter 38 Jackson Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $15,000.00 Plaintiff $17,000.00$10,000.00

11/05/15 14CV0136 Hickey 403 Sandusky Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$48,000.00 Plaintiff $32,000.00$32,000.00

11/05/15 14CV0102 Mongeau 410 North Street, Republic, Ohio 44867 $75,000.00 Plaintiff $50,000.00$50,000.00

11/05/15 14CV0261 Provino 3453 South Township Road 66, New 

Riegel, Ohio 44853-9602

$43,500.00 Plaintiff $97,000.00$29,000.00

11/05/15 15CV0110 Wickham 2727 West US Highway 224, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

$123,000.00 Plaintiff $82,000.00$82,000.00

11/19/15 15CV0116 Innis 0 South State Route 100, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$-00$1,328.39

11/19/15 15CV0116 Innis 2320 South State Route 100, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

Daniel J. and Peggy L. 

Ewald

$18,000.00$9,510.33

11/19/15 15CV0139 Steinmetz 45 Erie Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $21,000.00 Michael T. and Carol L. 

Theis

$15,000.00$14,000.00

11/19/15 15CV0032 Studer 9260 East County Road 6, Bloomville, 

Ohio 44818

$126,000.00 James P. and Jeanne B. 

Martin

$90,000.00$84,000.00

11/19/15 15CV0163 Tiell, Deceased 5991 North State Route 53, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883-8715

$15,000.00 Plaintiff $10,000.00$10,000.00

11/19/15 14CV0358 Williams 800 South Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$45,000.00 Plaintiff $30,000.00$30,000.00

12/03/15 15CV0135 Eibling 142 and 0 North State Route 101, 

Tiffin, Ohio 44883

$145,000.00 BEKS, LTD $96,667.00$96,667.00

12/03/15 15CV0213 Halbisen 5802 North Township Road 82, 

Bellevue, Ohio 44811

$60,000.00 Michael A. and Melissa A. 

Hicks

$87,200.00$40,000.00
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12/03/15 15CV0187 Harding 216 East North Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$5,568.53

12/03/15 15CV0187 Harding 212 East North Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$7,637.07

15CV0116 Innis 0 South State Route 100, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$-00$1,328.39

15CV0116 Innis 2320 South State Route 100, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

$-00$9,510.33

15CV0103 Ledwedge 94 Sycamore Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $85,000.00 N/A $-00$56,667.00

12/03/15 15CV0205 Masser 520 and 0 North Countyline Street, 

Fostoria, Ohio 44830

$50,000.00 Plaintiff $33,334.00$33,334.00

12/17/15 15CV0229 Easterday 5226 State Route 4, Attica, Ohio 44807 $65,000.00 Plaintiff $43,334.00$43,334.00

12/17/15 15CV0187 Harding 212 East North Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$7,637.07

12/17/15 15CV0187 Harding 216 East North Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$5,568.53

13CV0148 Hornyak 12692 Township Road 178, Bellevue, 

Ohio 44811

$33,500.00 N/A $-00$22,334.00

14CV0143 Magers 93 Apple Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $28,000.00 N/A $-00$18,667.00

15CV0102 Marshall 1212 Stoner Road, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$33,000.00 N/A $-00$22,000.00

12/17/15 15CV0037 Ortiz 333 West North Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$65,000.00 Plaintiff $43,334.00$43,334.00

12/17/15 15CV0153 Ritchie 1163 South Central Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$31,000.00 Plaintiff $20,667.00$20,667.00
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12/17/15 15CV0208 Wilson 15 Jefferson Street, Bloomville, Ohio 

44818

No Bid No Sale $-00$3,044.52

12/17/15 15CV0208 Wilson 0 Jefferson Street, Bloomville, Ohio 

44818

No Bid No Sale $-00$1,317.94

15CV0141 Hunker 270 First Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $15,000.00 N/A $-00$10,000.00

12/31/15 15CV0227 Hupp 97 First Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $21,000.00 Plaintiff $14,000.00$14,000.00

15CV0223 Mulvane 156 Hall Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $9,000.00 N/A $-00$6,000.00

12/31/15 15CV0221 Stark 7 Eden Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $81,000.00 Plaintiff $54,000.00$54,000.00

12/31/15 15CV0208 Wilson 0 Jefferson Street, Bloomville, Ohio 

44818

No Bid No Sale $-00$1,317.94

12/31/15 15CV0208 Wilson 15 Jefferson Street, Bloomville, Ohio 

44818

No Bid No Sale $-00$3,044.52


