
Past Sheriff Sale List Friday, January 31, 2014

Date of

Sale

Case No Defendant Legal Address Appraisal

Amount

Purchaser Purchase

Price

Sale

Cancelled

Starting Bid

01/03/13 11CV0494 Aldrich 209 East Fremont Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$5,310.06

01/03/13 12CV0146 Ceballos 491 North Sandusky Street, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$48,000.00 Plaintiff $32,000.00$32,000.00

12CV0241 David 664 Northview Drive, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$65,000.00 N/A $-00$43,334.00

12CV0189 Davison 11203 West State Route 18, Fostoria, 

Ohio 44830

$65,000.00 N/A $-00$43,334.00

01/03/13 11CV0402 Dorbin 223 East Crocker Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$21,000.00 Plaintiff $53,560.00$14,000.00

01/03/13 12CV0321 Funk 333 McDougal Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$6,129.06

01/03/13 12CV0321 Funk 824 South Poplar Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$4,502.07

01/03/13 11CV0392 Graham 143 Madison Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $42,000.00 Plaintiff $28,000.00$28,000.00

01/03/13 12CV0176 Hampshire 8371 South State Route 67, Sycamore, 

Ohio 44882

$72,000.00 Plaintiff $64,028.67$48,000.00

01/03/13 12CV0340 Johnson 183 Ohio Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $39,000.00 Plaintiff $27,000.00$26,000.00

12CV0166 McCain 557 North Washington Street, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

$99,000.00 N/A $-00$66,000.00

12CV0174 McLaughlin 70 Grand Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $51,000.00 N/A $-00$34,000.00

01/03/13 12CV0201 Miller 44 West Market Street, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$45,000.00 Plaintiff $30,000.00$30,000.00



Date of

Sale

Case No Defendant Legal Address Appraisal

Amount

Purchaser Purchase

Price

Sale

Cancelled

Starting Bid

12CV0141 Orpurt 1205 North Union Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$75,000.00 N/A $-00$50,000.00

01/03/13 12CV0172 Reinhart 1315 Columbus Avenue, Unit A, 

Fostoria, Ohio 44830

$102,000.00 Plaintiff $68,000.00$68,000.00

01/03/13 11CV0190 Rosales 525 McDougal Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$32,000.00 No Bid No Sale $-00$21,334.00

12CV0324 Slemmer 1300 West County Road 6, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$30,000.00 N/A $-00$20,000.00

01/03/13 12CV0112 Stewart 327 Sumner Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830-3166

$46,000.00 Plaintiff $30,667.00$30,667.00

12CV0078 Ward 220 West Tiffin Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$30,000.00 N/A $-00$20,000.00

08CV0136 Wise 1041 Gerlock Drive, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$110,000.00 N/A $-00$73,334.00

01/17/13 12CV0345 Cousin 203 North Union Street, Fostoria, OH 

44830

$60,000.00 Plaintiff $92,400.00$40,000.00

01/17/13 12CV0272 Wilson 310 West Culbertson Street, Fostoria, 

Ohio 44830

$46,000.00 Plaintiff $30,667.00$30,667.00

11CV0308 Woodruff 919 South Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$28,000.00 N/A $-00$18,667.00

12CV0093 Biller 351 North Sandusky Street, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$66,000.00 N/A $-00$44,000.00

01/31/13 12CV0244 Curatti 315 North Sandusky Street, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$63,000.00 Plaintiff $42,000.00$42,000.00

01/31/13 12CV0359 Drown 0 Ohio Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 No Bid No Sale $-00$3,140.48

12CV0370 Fourtner 151 & V/L's Second Avenue, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

$58,900.00 N/A $-00$39,267.00
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Case No Defendant Legal Address Appraisal
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Cancelled
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01/31/13 12CV0354 Hossler, Sr. 535 Gormley Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$8,251.10

12CV0334 Juliano 990 South township Road 81, Attica, 

Ohio 44807

$55,000.00 N/A $-00$36,667.00

01/31/13 12CV0355 Keaton 105 East High Street, Attica, Ohio 

44807

$55,000.00 Plaintiff $36,667.00$36,667.00

12CV0231 Kimble 426 West Culbertson Street, Fostoria, 

Ohio 44830

$23,000.00 N/A $-00$15,334.00

01/31/13 12CV0307 Layton 514 East Jackson Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$35,000.00 Plaintiff $23,334.00$23,334.00

01/31/13 12CV0297 Magers 28 Melissa Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $35,000.00 Plaintiff $23,334.00$23,334.00

12CV0102 Miller 368 West Market Street, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$60,000.00 N/A $-00$40,000.00

01/31/13 12CV0382 Platt 96 Riverside Drive, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $35,000.00 Plaintiff $23,334.00$23,334.00

01/31/13 12CV0168 Redford 16 Linda Lane, Bloomville, Ohio 44818 $45,000.00 Plaintiff $30,000.00$30,000.00

01/31/13 12CV0086 Runion 152 2nd Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $57,000.00 Plaintiff $38,000.00$38,000.00

01/31/13 12CV0383 Sherman 286 Jefferson Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $28,500.00 Plaintiff $19,000.00$19,000.00

12CV0251 Warner 14152 County Road 34, Bellevue, Ohio 

44811

$69,000.00 N/A $-00$46,000.00

12CV0363 Willman 224 Coe Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $106,000.00 N/A $-00$70,667.00

12CV0177 Young 362 Wall Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $60,000.00 N/A $-00$40,000.00
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12CV0414 Breidenbach 3370 South Township Road 113, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

$156,000.00 N/A $-00$104,000.00

02/14/13 12CV0241 David 664 Northview Drive, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$65,000.00 Plaintiff $45,000.00$43,334.00

02/14/13 12CV0359 Drown 0 Ohio Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 No Bid No Sale $-00$3,140.48

11CV0378 Fitch 179 Circular Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $36,000.00 N/A $-00$24,000.00

02/14/13 10CV0234 Grant 100 Miami Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $27,000.00 Plaintiff $18,000.00$18,000.00

12CV0190 Hanna 306 Water Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $54,000.00 N/A $-00$36,000.00

02/14/13 12CV0354 Hossler, Sr. 535 Gormley Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$8,251.10

02/14/13 12CV0149 Kramer 121 Lindsay Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $93,000.00 No Bid No Sale $-00$62,000.00

02/14/13 12CV0015 Legron, Jr. 136 Schonhardt Street, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$69,000.00 Plaintiff $46,000.00$46,000.00

02/14/13 12CV0327 Magers, Jr. 299 Clay Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $57,000.00 Aaron M. McCulla $38,000.00$38,000.00

12CV0221 Martinez 311 South Wood Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$30,000.00 N/A $-00$20,000.00

02/14/13 12CV0150 Sadler 2533 South US Highway 23, Alvada, 

Ohio 44802

$42,000.00 Plaintiff $28,000.00$28,000.00

02/28/13 12CV0222 Broome 627 Columbus Avenue, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$18,000.00 Plaintiff $12,000.00$12,000.00

02/28/13 12CV0351 Dube 0 South Cadwallader Street, Fostoria, 

Ohio 44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$3,262.21
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02/28/13 12CV0351 Dube 112 South Cadwallader Street, 

Fostoria, Ohio 44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$5,985.15

02/28/13 12CV0211 Gifford 48 Towne and Country Drive, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

$117,000.00 Plaintiff $78,000.00$78,000.00

02/28/13 12CV0277 Halbisen 81 Oak Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $60,000.00 Plaintiff $47,000.00$40,000.00

02/28/13 10CV0060 Hale 35-37 Lindsay Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$36,000.00 Richard and Linda Gray $45,000.00$24,000.00

02/28/13 12CV0320 Mendez 624 Northview Drive, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$26,000.00 Joseph A. Theis and 

Rebecca A. Theis

$18,000.00$17,334.00

10CV0556 Morgart 966 North Union Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$48,000.00 N/A $-00$32,000.00

02/28/13 12CV0188 Nepper 438 Clinton Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $36,000.00 Frederick J. Reimer and 

Rosemarie Reimer

$27,500.00$24,000.00

02/28/13 12CV0364 Sewell 720 Nickie Lane, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 $87,000.00 Plaintiff $58,000.00$58,000.00

12CV0238 Spahr, Jr. 34 Oil Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $42,000.00 N/A $-00$28,000.00

02/28/13 11CV0460 Vision Realty 182 North Sandusky Street, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

Franklin P. Laney $12,000.00$10,690.92

08CV0136 Wise 1041 Gerlock Drive, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$110,000.00 N/A $-00$73,334.00

02/28/13 12CV0171 Yoder 624 Lexington Avenue, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$36,000.00 Plaintiff $24,000.00$24,000.00

03/14/13 12CV0421 Alvarado 179 Melmore Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $55,000.00 Plaintiff $63,986.00$36,667.00

03/14/13 12CV0093 Biller 351 North Sandusky Street, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$66,000.00 Plaintiff $44,000.00$44,000.00
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Case No Defendant Legal Address Appraisal
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Purchaser Purchase
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Cancelled
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03/14/13 12CV0408 Brashares 215 South Main Street and Vacant Lots, 

Attica, Ohio 44807

$45,000.00 Plaintiff $30,000.00$30,000.00

12CV0189 Davison 11203 West State Route 18, Fostoria, 

Ohio 44830

$65,000.00 N/A $-00$43,334.00

03/14/13 12CV0386 Dawson 643 Northview Drive, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$44,000.00 No Bid No Sale $-00$29,334.00

03/14/13 12CV0351 Dube 0 South Cadwallader Street, Fostoria, 

Ohio 44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$3,262.21

03/14/13 12CV0351 Dube 112 South Cadwallader Street, 

Fostoria, Ohio 44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$5,985.15

03/14/13 12CV0377 Dukes 243 West Crocker Street, Fostoria, 

Ohio 44830

$40,000.00 Plaintiff $26,667.00$26,667.00

03/14/13 12CV0367 Dunsmore 6881 County Road 34, Green Springs, 

Ohio 44836

$35,000.00 Plaintiff $23,334.00$23,334.00

03/14/13 11CV0490 Gross 7911 County Road 29, Flat Rock, Ohio 

44828

$66,000.00 Plaintiff $44,000.00$44,000.00

03/14/13 12CV0349 Knowles 6353 County Road 29, Bellevue, Ohio 

44811

$46,000.00 Plaintiff $30,667.00$30,667.00

03/14/13 12CV0356 Murphy 331 Jefferson Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $65,000.00 Plaintiff $43,334.00$43,334.00

03/14/13 11CV0037 Schock 171 Hall Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $54,000.00 Plaintiff $36,000.00$36,000.00

03/14/13 12CV0447 Shrode 495 Melmore Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $68,000.00 Plaintiff $45,334.00$45,334.00

12CV0324 Slemmer 1300 West County Road 6, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$30,000.00 N/A $-00$20,000.00

11CV0460 Vision Realty 182 North Sandusky Street, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

N/A $-00$10,690.92



Date of
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Case No Defendant Legal Address Appraisal
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Purchaser Purchase
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Cancelled

Starting Bid

03/14/13 12CV0078 Ward 220 West Tiffin Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$30,000.00 Plaintiff $20,000.00$20,000.00

12CV0363 Willman 224 Coe Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $106,000.00 N/A $-00$70,667.00

03/28/13 12CV0071 Brooks 13142 East Township Road 178, 

Bellevue, Ohio 44811

$54,000.00 Plaintiff $36,000.00$36,000.00

03/28/13 11CV0151 Clinger 545 East Perry Street, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

Aaron J and Nicole R 

Schreiner

$15,500.00$10,267.00

12CV0422 Eachus 2620 East Township Road 1177, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

$125,000.00 N/A $-00$83,334.00

03/28/13 12CV0429 Kerlin 813 East High Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

Albert Gallo and Regina 

Depp

$8,013.68$5,335.17

03/28/13 12CV0429 Kerlin 0 East High Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 Albert Gallo and Regina 

Depp

$2,678.51$2,678.51

03/28/13 12CV0231 Kimble 426 West Culbertson Street, Fostoria, 

Ohio 44830

$23,000.00 Plaintiff $15,334.00$15,334.00

03/28/13 12CV0151 Krupp 729 Buckley Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$33,000.00 Plaintiff $22,000.00$22,000.00

03/28/13 12CV0346 Magers 97 Minerva Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $36,000.00 Plaintiff $24,000.00$24,000.00

03/28/13 12CV0457 Martinez 533 South Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$42,000.00 No Bid No Sale $-00$28,000.00

12CV0166 McCain 557 North Washington Street, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

$99,000.00 N/A $-00$66,000.00

03/28/13 12CV0102 Miller 368 West Market Street, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$60,000.00 Plaintiff $40,000.00$40,000.00

03/28/13 12CV0243 Smith, Jr. 3942 East County Road 62, Green 

Springs, Ohio 44836

$60,000.00 Plaintiff $40,000.00$40,000.00



Date of

Sale

Case No Defendant Legal Address Appraisal

Amount

Purchaser Purchase

Price

Sale

Cancelled
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12CV0433 Vanover 182 Walker Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 N/A $-00$10,837.47

04/11/13 12CV0170 Best 195 2nd Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $25,000.00 Plaintiff $16,667.00$16,667.00

04/11/13 12CV0206 Brashares 27 College Street, Bloomville, OH 

44818

$45,000.00 Craig A. Reinhart $36,000.00$30,000.00

04/11/13 12CV0152 Brown 1004 North Union Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$81,500.00 Plaintiff $150,685.00$54,334.00

04/11/13 12CV0350 Consolo 420 Hedges Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $68,000.00 Plaintiff $60,000.00$45,334.00

04/11/13 11CV0390 Craft 24 Jefferson Street, Bloomville, Ohio 

44818

$42,000.00 Plaintiff $28,000.00$28,000.00

04/11/13 12CV0365 Elchert 213 East Davis Street, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$22,000.00 Plaintiff $14,667.00$14,667.00

11CV0378 Fitch 179 Circular Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $36,000.00 N/A $-00$24,000.00

04/11/13 12CV0415 Hayes 167 Minerva Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $10,000.00 Plaintiff $6,667.00$6,667.00

12CV0429 Kerlin 813 East High Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$-00$5,335.17

12CV0429 Kerlin 0 East High Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 $-00$2,678.51

12CV0221 Martinez 311 South Wood Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$30,000.00 N/A $-00$20,000.00

12CV0455 Ridenour 143 East 6th Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$35,000.00 N/A $-00$23,334.00

04/11/13 12CV0399 Treft 210 2nd Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $32,000.00 Plaintiff $24,000.00$21,334.00



Date of

Sale

Case No Defendant Legal Address Appraisal

Amount

Purchaser Purchase

Price

Sale

Cancelled
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12CV0433 Vanover 182 Walker Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 N/A $-00$10,837.47

11CV0308 Woodruff 919 South Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$28,000.00 N/A $-00$18,667.00

12CV0396 Burwell 100 South Washington Street, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

N/A $-00$26,564.01

09CV0404 Digby 107 Longfellow Drive, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$33,000.00 N/A $-00$22,000.00

12CV0483 Farson 165 Minerva Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $47,500.00 N/A $-00$31,667.00

04/25/13 12CV0285 Glenn 5965 North State Route 635, Kansas, 

Ohio 44841

$19,000.00 Plaintiff $12,667.00$12,667.00

12CV0190 Hanna 306 Water Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $54,000.00 N/A $-00$36,000.00

04/25/13 12CV0149 Kramer 121 Lindsay Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $93,000.00 No Bid No Sale $-00$62,000.00

04/25/13 12CV0413 Kristofik 250 Jefferson Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 No Bid No Sale $-00$12,550.82

10CV0476 Macbeth 111 North Seneca Street, Attica, Ohio 

44807

$38,000.00 N/A $-00$25,334.00

04/25/13 13CV0002 Reino 343 North Sandusky, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $51,500.00 Plaintiff $34,334.00$34,334.00

04/25/13 12CV0397 Richards, Jr. 234 Rock Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 No Bid No Sale $-00$17,532.82

04/25/13 11CV0190 Rosales 525 McDougal Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$12,000.00

12CV0439 Ross 45 Clinton Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 N/A $-00$9,674.87



Date of

Sale

Case No Defendant Legal Address Appraisal

Amount

Purchaser Purchase

Price

Sale

Cancelled
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04/25/13 12CV0338 Scales 0 Cherry Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 No Bid No Sale $-00$3,398.99

04/25/13 12CV0434 Smith 72 North Monroe Street, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

No Bid No Sale $-00$18,096.38

12CV0475 Tey 1235 North Union Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

N/A $-00

12CV0251 Warner 14152 County Road 34, Bellevue, Ohio 

44811

$69,000.00 N/A $-00$46,000.00

12CV0396 Burwell 100 South Washington Street, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

$-00$26,564.01

13CV0004 Chapman 50 East Davis Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $63,000.00 N/A $-00$42,000.00

05/09/13 12CV0232 Daniel 15 Victoria Drive, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $135,000.00 Plaintiff $108,000.00$90,000.00

05/09/13 12CV0386 Dawson 643 Northview Drive, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$44,000.00 No Bid No Sale $-00$29,334.00

13CV0015 Ferguson 1045 North Township Road 183, 

Republic, Ohio 44867

$48,000.00 N/A $-00$32,000.00

12CV0485 Harple 217 Hudson Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $66,000.00 N/A $-00$44,000.00

05/09/13 12CV0413 Kristofik 350 Jefferson Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 No Bid No Sale $-00$12,550.82

05/09/13 12CV0212 Lunsford 16181 County Road 34, Bellevue, Ohio 

44811

$66,000.00 Plaintiff $95,698.00$44,000.00

05/09/13 12CV0397 Richards, Jr. 234 Rock Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 No Bid No Sale $-00$17,532.82

12CV0439 Ross 45 Clinton Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 N/A $-00$9,674.87



Date of
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Case No Defendant Legal Address Appraisal
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Cancelled
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05/09/13 12CV0338 Scales 0 Cherry Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 No Bid No Sale $-00$3,398.99

05/09/13 12CV0434 Smith 72 North Monroe Street, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

No Bid No Sale $-00$18,096.38

12CV0462 Swanigan 638 Columbus Avenue, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$39,000.00 N/A $-00$26,000.00

08CV0069 Wickham 2727 West US Highway 224, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

$120,000.00 N/A $-00$80,000.00

12CV0177 Young 362 Wall Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $60,000.00 N/A $-00$40,000.00

12CV0305 Baker 511 West Jefferson Street, Republic, 

Ohio 44867

N/A $-00

13CV0018 Bohlen 629 Buck N/A $-00

05/23/13 13CV0038 Cordero 8957 State Route 590, Bettsville, Ohio 

44815

$43,000.00 Plaintiff $38,950.00$28,667.00

05/23/13 12CV0411 Eatherton 640 Maple Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 $28,000.00 Plaintiff $18,667.00$18,667.00

05/23/13 13CV0007 Gannon 301 East Jones Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$8,903.46

05/23/13 12CV0371 Keiser 425 Union Court, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 Dennis & Kathleen Cline $7,407.84$7,407.84

05/23/13 12CV0443 Payne 31 Miami Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 Lenora M. Livingston $15,468.96$15,468.96

05/23/13 13CV0006 Roblero 620 Lexington Avenue, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$55,000.00 Plaintiff $36,667.00$36,667.00

13CV0019 Wilmoth 822 McDougal Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$45,000.00 N/A $-00$30,000.00



Date of
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Case No Defendant Legal Address Appraisal
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Purchaser Purchase
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Sale

Cancelled
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13CV0020 Craddolph 70 Gross Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $85,000.00 N/A $-00$56,667.00

06/06/13 13CV0030 Davis 31 Harrison Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 Robert A. Hager $9,357.92$9,357.92

06/06/13 12CV0308 Ehrenfried 281 Melmore Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $82,000.00 Plaintiff $108,171.00$54,667.00

12CV0033 Fadley Farms 6385 East State Route 18, Republic, 

OH 44867

$600,000.00 N/A $-00$400,000.00

06/06/13 13CV0007 Gannon 301 East Jones Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$8,903.46

10CV0433 Grine 6650 County Road 6, New Riegel, Ohio 

44859

$31,000.00 N/A $-00$20,667.00

06/06/13 13CV0023 Hanley 160 East Fourth Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$6,886.97

06/06/13 12CV0283 Johnson 282 West Market Street, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$60,000.00 Plaintiff $45,000.00$40,000.00

12CV0371 Keiser 425 Union Court, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 N/A $-00$7,407.84

12CV0443 Payne 31 Miami Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 N/A $-00$15,468.96

12CV0461 Pierce 1188 South Brace Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$20,000.00 N/A $-00$13,334.00

06/06/13 13CV0046 Rickard 816 Leonard Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$50,000.00 Plaintiff $40,000.00$33,334.00

12CV0251 Warner 14152 County Road 34, Bellevue, Ohio 

44811

$69,000.00 N/A $-00$46,000.00

06/06/13 13CV0028 Whatley 429 South Town Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$6,957.62



Date of
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06/06/13 13CV0028 Whatley 0 South Town Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$1,674.46

13CV0030 Davis 31 Harrison Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 N/A $-00$9,357.92

12CV0189 Davison 11203 West State Route 18, Fostoria, 

Ohio 44830

$65,000.00 N/A $-00$43,334.00

06/20/13 13CV0023 Hanley 160 East Fourth Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$6,886.97

06/20/13 12CV0387 Harris 1005 North Main, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 $77,000.00 Plaintiff $51,334.00$51,334.00

06/20/13 12CV0233 Hill 1218 Stoner Road, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$49,000.00 Plaintiff $32,667.00$32,667.00

06/20/13 13CV0054 Nye 132 Nicholas Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$29,000.00 Plaintiff $19,334.00$19,334.00

06/20/13 11CV0190 Rosales 525 McDougal Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

Plaintiff $12,000.00$12,000.00

06/20/13 13CV0028 Whatley 0 South Town Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$1,674.46

06/20/13 13CV0028 Whatley 429 South Town Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$6,957.62

12CV0305 Baker 511 West Jefferson Street, Republic, 

Ohio 44867

$30,000.00 N/A $-00$20,000.00

07/18/13 11CV0333 Bleckinger 8471 State Route 635, Kansas, Ohio 

44841

$36,000.00 Plaintiff $24,000.00$24,000.00

07/18/13 13CV0010 Bloom 3883 West State Route 12, Kansas, 

Ohio 44815

$126,000.00 Plaintiff $84,000.00$84,000.00

07/18/13 13CV0033 Clausen 207 Lelar Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $105,000.00 Plaintiff $91,000.00$70,000.00
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13CV0043 Ehresman 8 South Main Street, Attica, Ohio 44807 $24,000.00 N/A $-00$16,000.00

07/18/13 13CV0015 Ferguson 1045 North Township Road 183, 

Republic, Ohio 44867

$48,000.00 Plaintiff $35,000.00$32,000.00

07/18/13 12CV0020 Fitch 230 Second Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $54,000.00 Plaintiff $36,000.00$36,000.00

07/18/13 12CV0380 Fry 2171 North State Route 53, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$108,000.00 Plaintiff $105,000.00$72,000.00

07/18/13 12CV0199 Gurney 108 South Kilbourne Street, Republic, 

Ohio 44867

$48,000.00 Plaintiff $32,000.00$32,000.00

07/18/13 12CV0190 Hanna 306 Water Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $24,000.00 Plaintiff $16,000.00$16,000.00

07/18/13 12CV0452 Harper 135 Tomb Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 No Bid No Sale $-00$10,055.43

07/18/13 13CV0049 Hatter, III 905 Springville Ave., Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$18,000.00 Plaintiff $12,000.00$12,000.00

12CV0406 Hile 708 5th Avenue, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 $12,000.00 N/A $-00$8,000.00

07/18/13 12CV0471 House 168 Summit Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$36,000.00 Plaintiff $24,000.00$24,000.00

07/18/13 13CV0026 Johnson 843 Walnut Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$57,000.00 Plaintiff $51,000.00$38,000.00

07/18/13 12CV0149 Kramer 121 Lindsay Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $93,000.00 No Bid No Sale $-00$62,000.00

07/18/13 12CV0457 Martinez 533 South Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

Plaintiff $25,761.00$21,297.00

12CV0166 McCain 557 North Washington Street, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

$99,000.00 N/A $-00$66,000.00
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07/18/13 13CV0008 Reis 0 South Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$1,384.05

07/18/13 13CV0008 Reis 0 South Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$1,384.05

07/18/13 13CV0008 Reis 1255 North Township Road 20, 

Fostoria, Ohio 44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$4,346.70

07/18/13 12CV0161 Runion 4480 West Township Road 54, 

McCutchenville, Ohio 44844

$117,000.00 Plaintiff $78,000.00$78,000.00

12CV0446 Scholidon 816 Eastern Ave., Fostoria, Ohio 44830 $36,000.00 N/A $-00$24,000.00

07/18/13 12CV0286 Snowden 440 West Jackson Street, Fostoria, 

Ohio 44830

$33,000.00 Plaintiff $30,020.00$22,000.00

13CV0079 Wilkinson 114 Sullivan Street, Bettsville, Ohio 

44815

$21,000.00 N/A $-00$14,000.00

13CV0004 Chapman 50 East Davis Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $63,000.00 N/A $-00$42,000.00

08/01/13 13CV0061 Cherry 424 Union Court, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 $48,000.00 Plaintiff $32,000.00$32,000.00

08/01/13 12CV0450 Church 78 South Tecumseh Trail, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$111,000.00 Plaintiff $74,000.00$74,000.00

12CV0202 Frankart 134 Rock Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 $24,000.00 N/A $-00$16,000.00

08/01/13 12CV0452 Harper 135 Tomb Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 No Bid No Sale $-00$10,055.43

13CV0068 Holmer 214 North Madison Street, Republic, 

Ohio 44867

$27,000.00 N/A $-00$18,000.00

08/01/13 13CV0008 Reis 0 South Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

Scott A. Romaker $1,384.05$1,384.05
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08/01/13 13CV0008 Reis 1255 North Township Road 20, 

Fostoria, Ohio 44830

Scott A. Romaker $7,114.80$4,346.70

08/01/13 13CV0008 Reis 0 South Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

Scott A. Romaker $1,384.05$1,384.05

08/01/13 12CV0108 Roth Estate 6462 North County Road 5, Fostoria, 

Ohio 44830

$75,000.00 Julianne Wild and Garold 

Wild

$50,000.00$50,000.00

12CV0238 Spahr, Jr. 34 Oil Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $42,000.00 N/A $-00$28,000.00

12CV0230 Stock 7117 North County Road 33, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

$69,000.00 N/A $-00$46,000.00

08/01/13 12CV0462 Swanigan 638 Columbus Avenue, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$39,000.00 Plaintiff $26,000.00$26,000.00

08CV0136 Wise 1041 Gerlock Drive, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$110,000.00 N/A $-00$73,334.00

08/15/13 13CV0086 Barr 5082 East County Road 34, Green 

Springs, Ohio 44836

$49,000.00 Plaintiff $32,667.00$32,667.00

13CV0084 Cornett 561 North Washington Street, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

$19,000.00 N/A $-00$12,667.00

08/15/13 12CV0386 Dawson 643 Northview Drive, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

Douglas E. Affholder $27,000.00$22,100.00

13CV0057 Dorsey 306 West Tiffin Street, Attica, Ohio 

44807

$43,000.00 N/A $-00$28,667.00

08/15/13 12CV0483 Farson 165 Minerva Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $47,500.00 Plaintiff $31,667.00$31,667.00

13CV0123 Fritz 7461 North State Route 101, Clyde, 

Ohio 43410

$80,000.00 N/A $-00$53,334.00

08/15/13 13CV0063 Huffman 404 East Perry Street, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$25,000.00 Plaintiff $16,667.00$16,667.00
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12CV0441 Hussey 6355 North County Road 29, Bellevue, 

Ohio 44811

$40,000.00 N/A $-00$26,667.00

08/15/13 12CV0467 Lewis 10413 East Township Road 138, Clyde, 

Ohio 43410

$80,000.00 Plaintiff $55,000.00$53,334.00

13CV0109 Nolan/Ross 164 South Monroe Street, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$10,000.00 N/A $-00$6,667.00

08/15/13 13CV0022 Weisenberger 58-58 1/2 North Sandusky Street, 

Tiffin, Ohio 44883

$50,000.00 Plaintiff $33,334.00$33,334.00

08/15/13 12CV0177 Young 362 Wall Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $60,000.00 Plaintiff $40,000.00$40,000.00

08/29/13 12CV0398 Affholder 351 West South Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$19,000.00 Plaintiff $12,667.00$12,667.00

08/29/13 12CV0470 Criblez 7407 East US 224, Bloomville, Ohio 

44818

$50,000.00 Plaintiff $33,334.00$33,334.00

08/29/13 12CV0275 David 66 Erie Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $25,000.00 Plaintiff $16,667.00$16,667.00

08/29/13 12CV0189 Davison 11203 West State Route 18, Fostoria, 

Ohio 44830

$65,000.00 Plaintiff $43,334.00$43,334.00

08/29/13 12CV0461 Pierce 1188 South Brace Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$20,000.00 Plaintiff $13,334.00$13,334.00

08/29/13 10CV0049 Ritter 433 Lytle Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 Kellie J. Ritter and Scott F. 

Ritter

$6,726.90$6,726.90

08/29/13 13CV0100 Taylor 246 8th Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $40,000.00 Plaintiff $26,667.00$26,667.00

09/12/13 13CV0092 Barba 2634 North Township Road 155, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

$180,000.00 William & Tyfanie Rennels $170,000.00$120,000.00

13CV0020 Craddolph 70 Gross Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $85,000.00 N/A $-00$56,667.00
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09/12/13 10CV0433 Grine 6650 County Road 6, New Riegel, Ohio 

44859

$31,000.00 Plaintiff $20,667.00$20,667.00

12CV0481 Klingshirn 51 Jackson Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $30,000.00 N/A $-00$20,000.00

13CV0117 Kuzma 250 Second Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $15,000.00 N/A $-00$10,000.00

09/12/13 10CV0556 Morgart 966 North Union Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$48,000.00 Plaintiff $37,000.00$32,000.00

12CV0395 Pazmino-Stanfield 114 West Tiffin Street, Attica, Ohio 

44807

N/A $-00$3,899.56

09/12/13 13CV0072 Phounsavath 711 Circle Drive, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 $25,000.00 Plaintiff $46,750.00$16,667.00

13CV0142 Pullom 317 Elm Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 $66,000.00 N/A $-00$44,000.00

10CV0049 Ritter 433 Lytle Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 N/A $-00$6,726.90

13CV0075 Vitt 445 Union Court, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 $17,000.00 N/A $-00$11,334.00

13CV0079 Wilkinson 114 Sullivan Street, Bettsville, Ohio 

44815

$21,000.00 N/A $-00$14,000.00

13CV0004 Chapman 50 East Davis Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $63,000.00 N/A $-00$42,000.00

09/26/13 12CV0027 Heath 546 Spruce Street, Fostoria, OH 44830 No Bid No Sale $-00$4,829.09

09/26/13 12CV0406 Hile 708 5th Avenue, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 $12,000.00 Plaintiff $14,000.00$8,000.00

09/26/13 12CV0157 Larson 481 South Washington Street, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

$79,000.00 Plaintiff $52,667.00$52,667.00
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09/26/13 12CV0449 Nominee Estate 364 Water Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 No Bid No Sale $-00$11,363.09

12CV0141 Orpurt 1205 North Union Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$75,000.00 N/A $-00$50,000.00

12CV0395 Pazmino-Stanfield 114 West Tiffin Street, Attica, Ohio 

44807

$-00$3,899.56

13CV0074 Shawberry 2731 South Township Road 159, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

$45,000.00 N/A $-00$30,000.00

13CV0019 Wilmoth 822 McDougal Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$45,000.00 N/A $-00$30,000.00

10/10/13 13CV0017 Boes 9569 State Route 18, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$54,000.00 Plaintiff $36,000.00$36,000.00

13CV0107 Bridinger 4582 South Township Road 173, 

Bloomville, Ohio 44818

$80,000.00 N/A $-00$53,334.00

10/10/13 09CV0404 Digby 107 Longfellow Drive, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$33,000.00 Plaintiff $22,000.00$22,000.00

10/10/13 12CV0027 Heath 546 Spruce Street, Fostoria, OH 44830 No Bid No Sale $-00$4,829.09

10/10/13 13CV0128 Hill 24 Eden Street, Attica, Ohio 44807 $58,000.00 No Bid No Sale $-00$38,667.00

10/10/13 13CV0140 Hoffbauer 14 Park Place, Bloomville, Ohio 44818 $55,000.00 Plaintiff $36,667.00$36,667.00

10/10/13 12CV0149 Kramer 121 Lindsay Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $90,000.00 Aaron M. McCulla $61,000.00$60,000.00

10/10/13 12CV0449 Nominee Estate 364 Water Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 Aaron M. McCulla $11,600.00$11,363.09

10/10/13 12CV0096 Schwartz 301 Hedges, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $87,000.00 Aaron M. McCaulla $66,400.00$58,000.00
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10/10/13 11CV0168 Stahl 102 Erie Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 Aaron M. McCaulla $41,000.00$30,200.00

10/10/13 12CV0453 Thomas 151 East Clark Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$10,595.28

10/10/13 12CV0131 West 691 North State Route 587, Fostoria, 

Ohio 44830

$42,000.00 No Bid No Sale $-00$28,000.00

10/24/13 13CV0020 Craddolph 70 Gross Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $85,000.00 Plaintiff $68,000.00$56,667.00

10/24/13 13CV0144 Grover 217 North Sandusky Street, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

$60,000.00 Plaintiff $40,000.00$40,000.00

10/24/13 12CV0334 Juliano 990 South Township Road 81, Attica, 

Ohio 44807

$55,000.00 Plaintiff $36,667.00$36,667.00

10/24/13 12CV0446 Scholidon 816 Eastern Ave., Fostoria, Ohio 44830 $36,000.00 No Bid No Sale $-00$24,000.00

13CV0247 Taylor 7685 North Township Road 80, 

Bellevue, Ohio 44811

$65,000.00 N/A $-00$43,334.00

10/24/13 12CV0453 Thomas 151 East Clark Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$10,595.28

12CV0396 Burwell 100 South Washington Street, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

N/A $-00$26,564.01

11/07/13 11CV0151 Clinger 545 East Perry Street, Tiffin, Ohio 

44883

Aaron M. McCulla $12,100.00$10,250.00

13CV0135 Hacker 8157 East Township Road 58, 

Bloomville, Ohio 44818

$4,500.00 N/A $-00$3,000.00

12CV0410 Paul 304 Wyandotte Street and Vacant 

Land on Wyandotte Street and Fremont 

Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830

$21,000.00 N/A $-00$14,000.00

13CV0055 Rhodes 368 Perry Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 $52,000.00 N/A $-00$34,667.00
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12CV0305 Baker 511 West Jefferson Street, Republic, 

Ohio 44867

$30,000.00 N/A $-00$20,000.00

11/21/13 13CV0103 Blaser 900 Walnut Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$34,000.00 Plaintiff $22,667.00$22,667.00

11/21/13 13CV0080 Bowling 104 King Street, Bettsville, Ohio 44815 $49,000.00 Plaintiff $116,568.92$32,667.00

12CV0396 Burwell 100 South Washington Street, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

$26,564.01

11/21/13 13CV0084 Cornett 561 North Washington Street, Tiffin, 

Ohio 44883

$19,000.00 Plaintiff $12,667.00$12,667.00

11/21/13 13CV0272 Hook 327 West High Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$61,000.00 Plaintiff $42,500.00$40,667.00

13CV0099 Huss 742 Walnut Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

$14,000.00 N/A $-00$9,334.00

11/21/13 13CV0146 Kimmet 166 Tomb Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $20,000.00 Plaintiff $13,334.00$13,334.00

11/21/13 13CV0163 Meade 8555 Township Road 178, Green 

Springs, Ohio 44836

$52,000.00 Plaintiff $46,000.00$34,667.00

13CV0075 Vitt 445  Union Court, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 $17,000.00 N/A $-00$11,334.00

11/21/13 13CV0079 Wilkinson 114 Sullivan Street, Bettsville, Ohio 

44815

$21,000.00 Plaintiff $51,000.00$14,000.00

12/05/13 12CV0479 Abner 411 East Tiffin, Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$17,959.77

12/05/13 13CV0089 Boice 324 West Fremont Street, Fostoria, 

Ohio 44830

$9,000.00 Plaintiff $6,000.00$6,000.00

13CV0004 Chapman 50 East Davis Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $63,000.00 N/A $-00$42,000.00
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12CV0322 Huffman 44 Longfellow Drive, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $45,000.00 N/A $-00$30,000.00

12/05/13 13CV0251 Kimble 613 Fifth Avenue, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 William J. Ferguson $16,500.00$8,939.70

12CV0481 Klingshirn 51 Jackson Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $30,000.00 N/A $-00$20,000.00

12/05/13 13CV0232 O'Connell 148 Mohawk Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $33,000.00 Plaintiff $22,000.00$22,000.00

13CV0235 Salas 1737 East County 51, Old Fort, Ohio 

44861

$9,000.00 N/A $-00$6,000.00

12/19/13 12CV0479 Abner 411 East Tiffin, Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$17,959.77

13CV0138 Bauer 199 Huss Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $72,000.00 N/A $-00$48,000.00

12/19/13 13CV0107 Bridinger 4582 South Township Road 173, 

Bloomville, Ohio 44818

$80,000.00 Plaintiff $53,334.00$53,334.00

13CV0169 Frederick 114 Union Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $48,000.00 N/A $-00$32,000.00

12/19/13 13CV0128 Hill 24 Eden Street, Attica, Ohio 44807 $58,000.00 Plaintiff $38,667.00$38,667.00

13CV0251 Kimble 613 Fifth Avenue, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 N/A $-00$8,939.70

12/19/13 13CV0270 Klotz 222 East Jones Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$6,457.29

13CV0263 Mcbeth 1395 North Township Road 21, 

Fostoria, Ohio 44830

$42,000.00 N/A $-00$28,000.00

12/19/13 13CV0250 Redick 721 Buckley Street, Fostoria, Ohio 

44830

No Bid No Sale $-00$6,382.22


